

ITEM #16 - GRADER & UNDERBODY SCRAPER BLADES						
Company Name	Qty.	Size	Blade Type	Price Per Ft.	Total	Exceptions
Valk Manufacturing	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Single Bevel - Thru-Hardened	No Bid		
	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru Hardened	\$ 10.17	\$ 17,085.60	
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Single Bevel - Flame Hardened	No Bid		
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 12.25	\$ 89,964.00	
				Total	\$ 107,049.60	
Wear Parts & Equipment Co.	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Single Bevel - Thru-Hardened	No Bid		Minimum purchase \$6000.00 per single shipment with single destination
	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru Hardened	\$ 11.23	\$ 18,866.40	
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Single Bevel - Flame Hardened	No Bid		
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 13.65	\$ 100,245.60	
				Total	\$ 119,112.00	
Heights Machinery	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Single Bevel - Thru-Hardened	N/A		Pricing firm for only 6 months, approximate delivery is 4 weeks A.R.O. 50-Piece minimum order for each order.
	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 11.37	\$ 19,101.60	
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Single Bevel - Thru-Hardened	N/A		
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 13.81	\$ 101,420.64	
				Total	\$ 120,522.24	
Winter Equipment	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	N/B		Single bevel not available until end of November. Prices can be held for 6 months. Note - Price Per Blade, not Ft.
	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 11.62	\$ 21,319.20	
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	N/B		
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 14.13	\$ 103,770.72	
				Total	\$ 123,292.32	
Nordik Blades	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 14.08	\$ 23,654.40	
	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 11.31	\$ 19,000.80	
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 16.56	\$ 121,616.64	
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 13.27	\$ 97,454.88	
				Total	\$ 261,726.72	
St. Regis Culvert	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	N/A		Prices are firm for 90 days from bid date only
	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 15.10	\$ 25,368.00	
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 18.52	\$ 136,010.88	
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 16.64	\$ 122,204.16	
				Total	\$ 283,583.04	
Michigan CAT	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	No Bid		
	1,680 LIN. FT. (240 Blades)	5/8" x 8" x 7'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 14.30	\$ 24,024.00	
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 19.14	\$ 140,564.16	
	7,344 LIN. FT. (1,224 Blades)	3/4" x 8" x 6'	Curved Double Bevel - Thru-Hardened	\$ 16.97	\$ 124,627.68	
				Total	\$ 289,215.84	